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It is important to understand author Devan Orr’s 
definition of “celebrity” in the article Privacy Issues and the 
Paparazzi. Orr indicates that the increased privacy that 
California’s legislation provides to celebrities is an 
appropriate step to address celebrities’ privacy concerns. Orr 
focuses on the fact that the legislation amendments that 
increase privacy protection are intended to remedy safety 
concerns, especially Assembly Bill 1356, which explicitly 
states “the plaintiff reasonably fearing for his or her safety.”1 
Next, recall that Orr goes on to state that the use of the 
primary assumption of risk defense would most likely be 
ineffective in this context. This is because, the author argues, 
being a celebrity is not inherently dangerous and thus does 
not justify an assumption of risk on the celebrity’s part when 
he or she is photographed or recorded by the paparazzi.  

It is that statement with which this note takes issue. 
Though the article focuses much of its attention on the 
relationship between the status of celebrity parents and its 
effect on the privacy of their children, this note does not 
address that concern. This note instead contests the 
definition of “celebrity” utilized in the article and thus 
argues against one of the primary public policy rationales 
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put forward in favor of increased privacy protection for 
celebrities. 

The Oxford English Dictionary defines “celebrity” 
as “a person of celebrity; a celebrated person: a public 
character.”2 In contrast, the author, though not explicitly, 
indicates that a celebrity is defined by what he or she does 
for a career. Those professions could include acting or 
singing. However, that is not what is indicated by the Oxford 
definition of celebrity, which only indicates that celebrities 
are individuals who possess public personas.3  

In fact, one example is President Obama and his 
family, whose images are often photographed and followed, 
though neither he nor his family hold themselves out as 
singers or actors. A president’s celebrity status is further 
evidenced by the fact that Black’s Law Dictionary 
acknowledges a president’s status in its section on the 
Executive Branch when it states that “[t]he president is not 
only the celebrity of celebrities, he is a man of enormous and 
growing power.”4 Though it can be argued that President 
Obama is not always photographed for stereotypical 
magazines that utilize paparazzi photographs, one must 
recall August of 2014, when the President was photographed 
and criticized for one of his most famous fashion choices, 
sparking memes and tweets across the Internet.5 To be sure, 
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it can be acknowledged that a president may more 
appropriately fit into the category of “politician,” but the 
definition of celebrity encompasses individuals of public 
recognition, including politicians. Because of this definition, 
these celebrities are individuals who have put themselves in 
the public eye.6 As Orr acknowledges, many celebrities have 
endorsement contracts or movie deals, which necessitate 
extensive public relations and appearances. 

 Some individuals criticize celebrities — or, 
essentially, public figures — when they do insist on 
increased privacy, because the celebrities “make their living 
in the public eye.” 7  Considering this fact, the same 
individuals also question how much privacy celebrities 
should even expect.8 To be sure, some individuals indicate 
that celebrities’ presence in the public eye should not alone 
make them susceptible to constant surveillance; but if a 
celebrity goes out seeking media attention and the media 
turns on him or her, it is a lot more difficult to keep the media 
out of his or her business from that point forward.9 In fact, 
media commentator Mark Borkowski stated that celebrities 
should realize that, to a certain extent, they are public 
property and must strive for a delicate balance between 
promotion and maneuvering through their personal lives.10 

Additionally, celebrities enjoy their celebrity status 
and all of the benefits that accompany their status as a result 
of media attention. Sometimes termed a symbiotic 
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relationship or a “vicious cycle,”11 much attention has 
been paid to the mutually beneficial relationship that the 
media and celebrities enjoy. For example, in April of 2014, 
Rolling Stone published an article that detailed the author’s 
ride in the passenger seat alongside a paparazzo for two 
weeks while he was on the hunt for celebrities to 
photograph. 12  Some of the candid comments that the 
paparazzi provided indicate a suspicion of how the 
celebrities utilize the media attention in their favor. For 
example, one paparazzo criticized celebrities who travel to 
popular places in West Hollywood accompanied by their 
children, and who are equipped with the knowledge that 
many celebrities are photographed there.13 The paparazzo 
stated that celebrities who guard their kids’ privacy, like 
Matt Damon, “simply don’t take [their children] to pap hot 
zones.”14 Ironically, Halle Berry, a noted advocate for the 
increased privacy legislation in California,15 was accused of 
taking her own child to a popular pumpkin patch in West 
Hollywood, known for its heightened paparazzi activity.16 
Alternatively, another paparazzo revealed that there are 
instances where celebrities hire paparazzi to conduct fake 
photo shoots or even to join the celebrity on vacation so that 
they can receive a portion of the funds that the photographs 
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generate.17 One could question whether the celebrities 
themselves are partially to blame for their decreased 
personal privacy in both their professional and personal 
lives. 

Another issue with the underlying policy rationale 
provided by the author’s definition of “celebrity” is why 
celebrities and their children should be entitled to more 
privacy protection than other individuals. Celebrities, by 
definition, are atypical individuals, due to their well-known 
status in society. This is a fact that the author acknowledges 
when she textually identifies celebrities as separate from 
“normal people.” However, it must be emphasized that 
celebrities, too, are subject to the Constitution. It should be 
of concern that California’s recently enacted amendments to 
civil and criminal statutes may violate the equal protection 
that is afforded to every individual.18 The Equal Protection 
Clause of the Constitution emphasizes that “No state shall 
make or enforce any law which shall abridge the privileges 
or immunities of citizens of the United States; nor shall any 
state deprive any person of life, liberty, or property, without 
due process of law; nor deny to any person within its 
jurisdiction the equal protection of the laws.” 19  Critics 
initially note that the law may be unconstitutional because it 
specifically targets photographers while they are doing 
something that is potentially constitutionally protected.20 

However, another concerning constitutional issue 
that may be a result of the California laws is how the laws 
affect citizens as a whole. The cited amendment, when 
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paired with the now common knowledge of Internet and 
mobile phone surveillance of the networked world,21 begs 
the question whether California should permit this increased 
protection of celebrities’ privacy even though other 
individuals do not share in that same privilege. After all, the 
Constitution does not distinguish between individuals who 
spend their lives in the public eye; instead, the Constitution 
focuses on the language of “any person.”22 

Though it is commendable that the members of the 
California Legislature are turning their attention to the safety 
concerns of some of their most famous residents, it is 
possible that the focus on increased privacy legislation for 
celebrities is misplaced. Instead, the issue of paparazzi 
harassment should perhaps be addressed through legislation 
that targets the restless demand for news, photographs, video 
recordings, and audio recordings of celebrities. 23  The 
increased demand for celebrity journalism could be what is 
fueling the aggressive tactics that the paparazzi employ, 
especially the potential monetary gain. 24  It is commonly 
understood that paparazzi target those with whom the public 
has a fascination, and that seems to be the main problem.25 
It is more likely than not that removing the market for 
celebrity media and the demand of its consumers would 
eradicate the presence of paparazzi altogether, and alleviate 
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safety as well as privacy concerns. One must ask the 
question: Would the paparazzi be so keen on following and 
documenting the lives of celebrities if there were no benefits 
of doing so? 


